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COMMENT
A HARD BATTLE FOR THE

WATCH INDUSTRY
While the Swiss watch has lost

none of its world prestige, it has cer-
tainly lost its relative share of the world
market. There was a time when four or
more watches out of five worn across
the world had a Swiss origin. Now the
proportion has fallen down to about
45 per cent—which is still honourable.
However, even though the Swiss watch
may decline in relative importance, the
world watch market is expanding so
rapidly that our watch industry will re-
main one of our booming export indus-
tries. The total sale of watches in the
world was 160 million pieces last year.
This is expected to rise to 300 million
in 1980, thus leaving plenty of pros-
pects to the Swiss watch industry, as
long as it can adapt itself to a changing
and competitive market.

The loss of the Swiss share of the
world market has benefitted mainly to
three powerful newcomers: America,
Russia and Japn. They have profited
from the weaknesses of the Swiss watch
industry. These weaknesses lie fore-
most in the dispersed structure of the
industry, in its sometimes archaic man-
agement, in an insufficient exploitation
of foreign markets, in too many small
firms and in a lack of concerted effort
in research and development. But our
watchmakers have been aware of these
shortcomings for a sufficintly long time
to have begun taking the necessary ac-
tion to correct them. The main and all-
important step that must be taken is to
create powerful units capable of impos-
ing themselves on the world market.
This automatically spells "merger",
either horizontal or vertical.

The creation of the SSIH group,
comprising Omega, Tissot, Lemania

and other less important firms, is a
good example of the former case. Other
examples are the creation of the Jac-
quet-Droz group and the Société des
Garde—Temps, which embodies De-
goumois & Co., Sandoz and Invica.
These "horizontal" mergers consisted
in the marriage of firms producing simi-
lar kinds of watches or the same com-
ponents thereof. The most recent watch
merger on record was of a "vertical"
type because it united together a string
of factories producing both watches

components. It was the takeover by
the ASUAG (Société générale de l'hor-
logerie suisse S.A.) of some ten small
watch undertakings which together
grossed a turnover of 200 million francs.
The ASUAG was up to then not a
watch manufacturer proper, but one of
the biggest watch-parts producers in the
world.

This far-reaching reorganisation
has caused some concern among
smaller watch manufacturers supplied
by ASUAG. They feared that they
would suffer from commercial discrimi-
nation.

Mergers do not, of course, solve
everything. Their main advantages lie
in sparing duplicated work, be it in
administration, development or produc-
tion. But they still leave considerable
managerial and personal problems to
solve. When a dozen family watch firms
nestle together to build a larger unit it
involves the reconciliation of a dozen
managements and a dozen production
programmes. Many quite small firms
have an amazing gamut of models and
designs intended to satisfy a very wide
geographical market. Two or three
hundred models would not be untypi-
cal. Such ambitious variety of produc-
tion was bound to be a strain on the
smaller firms and it was inevitable that
they should set their sights lower if
they wished to remain competitive—
and hence on the market. This has re-
suited in a situation where most of the
smaller firms without a super-name
(e.g. Richard and Patek Philippe) have

had to look for partners to survive.
This situation is incidentally reflected
on the list of Swiss watch agents in this
country. Many names have had to be
crossed out in the recent past, others
are now found under a single heading.

Many people (and Swiss persons
surprisingly foremost among them) like
to gullibly insist that the Japanese are
now producing watches as good and
far cheaper than our own—such being
the Japanese legend. Fortunately, the
Swiss watch industry has taken the Jap-
anese threat sufficiently seriously to re-
act in time and appropriately. The
ability to produce cheap watches is a
question of productive size, and this is
precisely what our watch industrialists
have been attempting to achieve in a
decade of continuous mergers. Cheap-
ness also depends on cost of living. The
cost and standard of living of Japan are
rising far faster than in Switzerland
(which admittedly suffers from infla-
tion, but managed to keep the rise in
cost of living down to 3 per cent last
year). Thus Japan's competitive edge
is bound to diminish rather than to im-
prove as the Swiss industry gets yet
better organised and as costs in Japan
increase. One possible danger to Switz-
erland's position could come from the
-labour situation. The watchmaking in-
dustry suffers generally from an acute
shortage of labour and from a general
move away from he watch assembly
lines. The jobs are generally poorly
paid and performed increasingly by
married foreign women. The watch in-
dustry would have been the first to suf-
fer from a successful Schwarzenbach
Initiative last year. The question that
remains is how to automate and mod-
ernise yet further. This problem will
only be solved when it is structured in
financially powerful units and when
more engineers will be attracted to-
wards it. This will necessarily take time
and one can only hope that its future
will not be jeopardised by a renewed
Schwarzenbach Initiative or a new
xenophobic movement.

(PMS)
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