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"SCHWEIZERBUND" (SWISS CLUB).
Annual General Meeting.

The Annual General Meeting of the " Schweizer-
bund " (Swiss Club) took place on Saturday,
February 23rd, at 74, Charlotte Street, W.Ü.

Mr. F. Delaloye was in the Chair, and there were
about 50 members present.

The President in his Annual Report dealt at some
length with the financial position of the Club, which
he described as " unsatisfactory ", this being partly
due to a considerable decrease in membership fees and
increased expenditure for repairs, etc. " If this Club
is to be carried on, " he said " it is essential that,
members take more interest ". Mr. Delaloye made a

strong appeal to all members to give more active
support and to intensify their efforts to obtain new
applicants. He informed the Meeting that the Hon.
Secretary, Mr. R. Weist, owing to illness, had had to
relinquish his post some time ago, and he warmly
thanked Mrs. M. Schneeberger for having taken his
place for the time being.

The auditor of the Club then explained the balance
sheet in detail, which closed with a considerable
deficit. After a short discussion both the President's
report and the accounts were accepted.

For the election of a new committee no names
were put forward. Mr. W. Meier took the chair pro
few), and it was largely due to him that a new
committee for the next financial year could be
presented. Before the elections took place the
temporary chairman thanked the outgoing president
and committee for the services they had rendered to
the Club. He joined the outgoing President in bis
appeal for an intensified activity, making various
suggestions such as reducing the subscription, etc.

The result of the elections was as follows : —
President, F. Delaloye; Vice-President, H. Caluori ;

Hon. Secretary, Mrs. M. Schneeberger (temporary);
Hon. Treasurer, J. Fischer; members of the
committee : Messrs. Türmer, Henry, Bravo, Bonomo,
Hausler, Michele, Mrs. Oggier, and Miss Friedrich.

In assuming the Chair again Mr. Delaloye
thanked Mr. Meier for his efficient conduct of the
Meeting, expressing the hope that the newly elected
officers would ensure the Club a more prosperous
future.

Before closing the meeting the President intro-
duced to the company the new stewards, Mr. & Mrs.
Eudiham, expressing to the former stewards Mr. &
Mrs. K. Caluori his appreciation for services rendered.

»ST.

NEW SWISSAIR APPOINTMENTS.

Swissair have appointed Mr. A. Weber District
Manager for the North of England and Manager of
their Manchester office. He was previously District
Manager for Scotland.

Mr. Weber succeeds Mr. F. Fraefel who becomes
the airline's District Manager in Calcutta, India.
Swissair will operate a new route to the Far East
through India from April 23rd.

Mr. Peter Kessler has been appointed Swissair's
new District Manager for Scotland and to take charge
of their Glasgow office. Before joining the company
in Switzerland last year, he was with a large
international travel agency, lately as branch manager
of one of their offices in Rome.
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